FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS (AMENDMENT)
ACT NO. 19 OF 2017

Arrangement of Sections
1 AMENAMENTS ...

2 (0011 01001 4 10= 1 11 2] SRR

Financial Ingtitutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017



REPUBLIC OF VANUATU

Assent: 02/01/2018
Commencement: 05/01/2018

FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS (AMENDMENT)
ACT NO. 19 OF 2017

An Act to amend the Financial Institutions Act [C2RB4], and for related
purposes.

Be it enacted by the President and Parliament!msvie

1 Amendments

The Financial Institutions Act [CAP 254] is amendexset out in the Schedule,
and any other item in the Schedule has effect daupto its terms.

2 Commencement
This Act commences on the day on which it is pigdsin the Gazette.

Financial Ingtitutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 2



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

SCHEDULE

AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONSACT
[CAP 254]

1 Subsection 1(1)
Insert in their correct alphabetical positions

“ “peneficial owner” means a natural person whamditely owns or ultimately
controls an applicant for a licence or a licensee;

“confidential information” means information thatsupplied to or obtained by
the Reserve Bank in the performance of its funstionthe exercise of its powers
under this Act, but does not include informatioatth

(a) can be disclosed under any provision of thig i
(b) is already in the public domain; or

(© consists of aggregate data from which no infdrom about a specific
person or business can be identified:;

“controller” of an applicant for a licence or aditsee means a person who
exercises influence, authority or power over deaisiabout the applicant’s or
licensee’s financial or operating policies, inchglias a result of, or by means of,
a trust, agreement, arrangement, understandingpotige, and “control” has a
corresponding meaning;

“domestic regulatory authorityheans a body or agency established by or under a
law of Vanuatu that:

(@) grants or issues under that law or any ogngricences, permits,
certificates, registrations or other equivaleninmissions; and

(b) performs any other regulatory function relatieé matter referred to in
paragraph (a), including developing, monitoringenforcing compliance
with standards or obligations prescribed by or utidat law or any other
law;

“Financial Intelligence Unit” means the Financiatdlligence Unit established
under section 4 of the Anti-Money Laundering anditer-Terrorism Financing
Act No. 13 of 2014;

Financial Ingtitutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 3



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

“foreign government agencyheans:
@) a body or agency established by or under afaaforeign country; or

(b) an arm, ministry, department, or instrumentaif the government of a
foreign country; or

(c) a body or agency of a foreign country set yadministrative act for
governmental purposes;

“foreign serious offence” means:

(@) an offence against a law of another country; ththe relevant act or
omission had occurred in Vanuatu, would be an cffeagainst the laws of
Vanuatu, for which the maximum penalty is impris@mnfor at least 12
months; or

(b) an offence prescribed by the regulations;

“foreign tax evasion offence” means conduct that:

@) amounts to an offence against a law of a faremuntry; and

(b) relates to a breach of a duty relating to angosed under the law of the
foreign country (whether or not that tax is imposeder a law of
Vanuatu); and

(© would be regarded by the courts of Vanuatunaesfeence of fraudulent
evasion of tax for which the maximum penalty is ilepnment for at least
12 months, had the conduct occurred in Vanuatu;

“guidelines” means guidelines made under sectign 21

“key person” of an applicant for a licence or &lisee means a beneficial owner,
owner, controller, director or manager of the aggoit or licensee;

“law enforcement agencyheans:
@) the Vanuatu Police Force; or
(b) the Office of the Public Prosecutor; or

(c) the department responsible for customs arhthtevenue; or
Financial Ingtitutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 4




SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

(d) the department responsible for immigration; or
(e) such other persons prescribed for the purpalsiss definition;

“owner” of an applicant for a licence or a licenseeans a person who has a legal
entitlement of 25% or more of the applicant ortisee by way of ownership of
shares or otherwise, and “own” and “ownership” haw@mrresponding meaning;

“regulatory law” means a law that provides for:

(@) the grant or issue of licences, permits, gediés, registrations or other
equivalent permissions; and

(b) other regulatory functions related to a mattéerred to in paragraph (a),
including monitoring or enforcing compliance wittaisdards or
obligations prescribed by that law;

“Sanctions Secretariat” means the Sanctions Se@eéstablished under
section 17 of the United Nations Financial Sanatiéet No. 6 of 2017;"

2 Subsection 1(1) (definition of “manager”)
Repeal the definition, substitute
““manager” of an applicant for a licence or a lisee means:

@) an individual who occupies the position of théef executive officer
(however described) of the applicant or licensee; o

(b) an individual who under the immediate authootyhe chief executive
officer or a director of the applicant or licensegercises the management
functions of the applicant or licensee;”

3 At the end of section 1
Add

“(6) For the purpose of the definition of a benigdiowner, ultimately owns
and ultimately controls include circumstances wimwvaership or control
is exercised:

@) through a chain of ownership; or

(b) by a means of indirect control that may notehkagal or equitable
force, or be based on legal or equitable rights.”

Financial Ingtitutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 5



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

4 Paragraph 6(2)(a)
(a) Delete “VT 2,000,000", substitute “VT 25 million”
(b) Delete “2 years”, substitute “15 years”

5 Paragraph 6(2)(b)
Delete “VT 10,000,000", substitute “VT 125 million”

6 Subsection 7(3)
Delete “VT 10,000,000", substitute “VT 125 million”

7 Paragraph 9(2)(a)
(a) Delete “VT 2,000,000", substitute “VT 25 million”
(b) Delete “2 years”, substitute “15 years”

8 Paragraph 9(2)(b)
Repeal the paragraph, substitute

“(b) in any other case - by a fine not exceedingMJ000,000 or the value of
the funds, whichever is the higher.”

9 After paragraph 11(1)(b)
Insert
“(ba) include the following information:

® details of each key person of the applicant;

(ii) details as required by the Reserve Bank ontiérea beneficial
owner of the applicant is a beneficial owner, owarecontroller of
an entity licensed or registered under a reguldewyof Vanuatu
or a foreign jurisdiction;

(i)  details of the source of funds used to pag tapital of the
applicant; and”

10 Paragraph 11(6)(a)
(a) Delete “VT 2,000,000", substitute “VT 15 million”
(b) Delete “2 years”, substitute “5 years”

11 Paragraph 11(6)(b)
Delete “VT 6,000,000", substitute “VT 75 million”

12 Paragraph 13(2)(d)
Repeal the paragraph, substitute

Financial Ingtitutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 6



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

“(d) each key person of the applicant is a fit @noper person; and

(da) the source of funds used to pay the capittdiefpplicant is
acceptable; and”

13 At the end of section 13
Add

“(4) Indeciding whether a key person of the agpiicis a fit and proper
person, the Reserve Bank must have regard to:

@) whether the person has been convicted offemad or is subject
to any criminal proceedings; and

(b) whether the person is listed on a United NatiBmancial
Sanctions list, a financial sanctions list under thmited Nations
Financial Sanctions Act No. 6 of 2017 or a finahsanctions list
under a law of any jurisdiction; and

(© any other fit and proper criteria in the guides.”

14 Paragraph 14(2)(a)
Delete “subsection 13(2)", substitute “subsections 13(2) and (4)”

15 Paragraph 17(1)(e)
Repeal the paragraph, substitute
“(e) contravenes any of the conditions of its licenor

(ea) fails to comply with subsection 50(1), or pd®s information under
subsection 50(1) that is not satisfactory to thedRee Bank under
subsection 50(4); or

(eb) contravenes any other provision of this Act; o

16 After subsection 17(1)
Insert
“(1A) In addition to subsection (1), the ResenanB may revoke a licence if:

(@) the licensee has contravened a provision oftiie-Money
Laundering and Counter-Terrorism Financing Act & of 2014
and that contravention has resulted in the usa ehdorcement
measure under Part 10AA of that Act; or

Financial Ingtitutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 7



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

(b) the fit and proper criteria are not met as negliunder this Act; or

(© the source of funds used to pay the capitéheficensee is not
acceptable.”

17 After subsection 21(2A)
Insert

“(2AB) Without limiting subsection (2A), the ReserBank may formulate
written guidelines setting out the criteria forelaining whether a person
is a fit and proper person.”

18 Subsection 27(3)
Delete “VT 500,000", substitute “VT 75 million”

19 Subsection 41(3)
Delete “VT 1,000,000", substitute “VT 125 million”

20 After paragraph 42(1)(b)
Insert
“(ba) the person has been convicted of:

0] an offence of money laundering under sectioflthe Proceeds
of Crime Act [CAP 284]; or

(ii) an offence of terrorism financing under sentt®of the Counter
Terrorism and Transnational Organised Crime ActfC343]; or

(i)  an offence against the United Nations Finah8anctions Act
No. 6 of 2017; or

(bb)  the person is listed on a United Nations FamglrSanctions list, a financial
sanctions list under the United Nations Financai&ions Act No. 6 of
2017 or a financial sanctions list under a lawmf purisdiction; or”

21 Subsection 42(3)
Delete “VT 5,000,000", substitute “VT 75 million”

22 Subsection 42(4)
(a) Delete “VT 1,000,000", substitute “VT 15 million”
(b) Delete “2 years”, substitute “5 years”

Financial Ingtitutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 8



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

23 Paragraph 42A(1)(b)
Repeal the paragraph, substitute

“(b) does not meet any other fit and proper créeni this Act or the
guidelines.”

24 Subsection 42A(5)
Delete “VT 5,000,000", substitute “VT 75 million”

25 Section 50
Repeal the section, substitute

“50 ReserveBank to begiven notice of certain matters
Q) If:

(@) a licensee makes an alteration to its memorarwharticles of
association; or

(b) a licensee makes an alteration to any othémiment providing for
its incorporation or establishment; or

(© a licensee makes a change to a key persore ditnsee; or

(d) there is a change in the circumstances of gpkeson of the
licensee that may affect whether he or she maedsidi proper
criteria; or

(e) there is a change in the source of funds usedy the capital of
the licensee;

the licensee must immediately give to the ResBeusk full particulars, in
writing, of the alteration or change, verified bgtatutory declaration
made by a director of the licensee.

(2) If a licensee fails to comply with subsect{@), the licensee commits an
offence punishable upon conviction by a fine natemding VT 125
million.

3) If a licensee fails to comply with subsect{d), the Reserve Bank may by
notice in writing to the licensee revoke the licegis licence under
section 17.

Financial Ingtitutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 9



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

(4)

(®)

S0A

)

()

@)

26

If a licensee does provide the informatiomepuired under subsection (1),
but the Reserve Bank is not satisfied:

@) that the key persons of the licensee are ft@oper persons to
fulfil the responsibilities of their positions hag regard to the
matters referred to in subsection 13(4); or

(b) as to the source of funds used to pay thealagfithe licensee;

the Reserve Bank may by notice in writing to flcerisee revoke the
licensee’s licence under section 17.

If an application is made to the Court undey kamv proposing a
compromise or arrangement that involves a licersekrector of the
licensee must ensure that the Reserve Bank:

(a) is served with a notice of any meeting orddrgthe Court and a
statement explaining the effect of the compromisarangement;
and

(b) is eligible to attend and be allowed to pap#te in and give advice
at any meeting of which such notice is given.

Licensee to obtain approval of Reserve Bank before entering certain
agreements

A licensee must consult with, and obtain thétem approval of, the
Reserve Bank before entering into any agreement for

@) the purchase or acquisition of the businesmother licensee; or

(b) the purchase or acquisition of the businessfafancial institution
outside Vanuatu by a domestic licensee.

The grounds on which the Reserve Bank may withlis approval under
subsection (1) include restraint of trade, monopdlipusiness and adverse
effect on the soundness of the financial systeNainuatu.

A licensee that contravenes subsection (1) cissrohan offence
punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding©b million.”

Subsection 51(5)

Delete “VT 1,000,000", substitute “VT 125 million”

Financial Institutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 10



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

27 Subsection 54(2)
(a) Delete “VT 1,000,000", substitute “VT 15 million”
(b) Delete “one year”, substitute “5 years”

28 Section 55
Repeal the section, substitute

“55  Disclosure of confidential infor mation

Q) The Reserve Bank or a court appointed manageexaminer, adviser or
any other person appointed by the Reserve BankruhideAct may
disclose confidential information if the disclosure

@) is required or authorised by the Court; or

(b) is made for the purpose of performing a functo exercising a
power under this Act; or

(© is made to the Financial Intelligence Unit floe purpose of
performing a function or exercising a power undher Anti-Money
Laundering and Counter-Terrorism Financing Act N®&.of 2014;
or

(d) is made to a supervisor within the meaninchefAnti-Money
Laundering and Counter-Terrorism Financing Act ®&.of 2014
for the purpose of performing a function or exéngsa power
under that Act; or

(e) is made to a law enforcement agency for thpgae of
investigating or prosecuting an offence againswadf Vanuatu
for which the maximum penalty is a fine of at led3$t1 million or
imprisonment for at least 12 months; or

)] is made to a law enforcement agency for theppse of
investigating or taking action under the ProceddSraome Act
[CAP 284]; or

(9) is made to a to domestic regulatory authootytifie purpose of
carrying out its regulatory functions; or

(h) is made to the Sanctions Secretariat for thpgae of performing a
function or exercising a power under the Unitedidta Financial
Sanctions Act No. 6 of 2017; or

Financial Institutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 11



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

® is made to a foreign government agency in ataonce with
section 55A.

(2) A person who contravenes subsection (1) comartitoffence punishable

upon conviction by:

@) for an individual-a fine not exceeding VT 18lion or
imprisonment for a term not exceeding 5 years,obh;tand

(b) for any other person - a fine not exceedingABTmillion.

55A Disclosur e of confidential information to foreign gover nment agency

The Reserve Bank, or a court appointed managexxaminer, adviser or any

other person appointed by the Reserve Bank ungeAtt, may disclose
confidential information about a licensee to a igmegovernment agency if:

(a) the Reserve Bank is satisfied that the discéomufor the purpose of:

® performing a function or exercising a power anthe foreign
government agency’s own regulatory legislationluding
investigating a breach of that legislation; or

(i) performing a function or exercising a poweden the foreign
jurisdiction’s anti-money laundering and counterdesm
financing regulation and supervision laws; or

(i)  performing a function or exercising a powarder the foreign
jurisdiction’s financial sanctions laws; or

(iv)  investigating or prosecuting a foreign seriaii@nce or a foreign

tax evasion offence; or

(V) investigating or taking action under the forejgrisdiction’s
proceeds of crime laws; and

(b) the Reserve Bank, or the court appointed managaminer, adviser or

other person appointed by the Reserve Bank undeAtt, is satisfied

that:

0] the information will be used for a proper regalry, supervisory or

law enforcement purpose; and

(i)  the agency is subject to adequate restrictmméurther disclosure.”

Financial Ingtitutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017

12



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

29 After section 57
Insert

“57A Reserve Bank may request information and documents

For the purpose of performing a function or exéngs power under this Act, the
Reserve Bank may request information or documentisoth, from any or all of
the following:

@) the Financial Intelligence Unit;

(b) a supervisor within the meaning of the Anti-MgriLaundering and
Counter-Terrorism Financing Act No. 13 of 2014;

(© the Sanctions Secretariat;
(d) a law enforcement agency;
(e) a domestic regulatory authority;

)] a foreign government agency that carries oantfions corresponding or
similar to the functions carried out by a body geiacy referred to in
paragraph (a), (b), (c), (d) or (e).”

30 Subsections 58(3), (4), (5), (6) and (7)
Repeal the subsections, substitute
“(3) Ifalicensee:

(@) fails to submit or delays the submission of axfigrmation
required under subsection (1); or

(b) submits any false or inaccurate informatiorurezg under that
subsection;

the licensee commits an offence punishable upawiction by a fine not
exceeding VT 75 million.

(4) If a licensee is required under subsectiondZubmit an auditor’s
certificate and the licensee fails to request gréfecate from its auditor,
the licensee commits an offence punishable upowiction by a fine not
exceeding VT 75 million.”

Financial Institutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 13



SCHEDULE
AMENDMENTS OF FINANCIAL INSTITUTIONS ACT [CAP 254]

31
(1)

)

®3)

(4)

(5)

(6)

Transitional provision for certain licensee info rmation

This provision applies to a licensee if, imnadly before the
commencement of this Act, the licensee’s licence indorce under the ;
Financial Institutions Act [CAP 254].

The licensee must provide the Reserve Bank thiéhinformation required
under subparagraphs 11(1)(ba)(i), (ii) and (iiitteé Financial Institutions
Act [CAP 254] as amended by this Act (“the additibmformation”)
within 6 months after the commencement of this Act.

If the licensee does not provide the additionfdrmation as required
under subsection (2), the Reserve Bank may byeatigvriting to the
licensee revoke the licensee’s licence.

If the licensee does provide the additionabinfation as required under
subsection (2), but the Reserve Bank is not satisfiith the additional
information having regard to the matters set oytaragraphs 13(2)(d) and
(da) of the Financial Institutions Act [CAP 254]@amended by this Act,
the Reserve Bank may by notice in writing to tleetisee revoke the
licensee’s licence.

Subsections 17(2) to (5), and sections 18,ntR2# of the Financial
Institutions Act [CAP 254] as amended by this Agplg to a revocation.

A term or expression used in this item hasstiiee meaning as in the
Financial Institutions Act [CAP 254] as amendedliog Act.

Financial Institutions (Amendment) Act No.19 of 2017 14



